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Competition 5 Verse References  
 

 
II Corinthians 4:4 

The god of this age has 
blinded the minds of 
unbelievers, so that they 
cannot see the light of the 
gospel that displays the glory 
of Christ, who is the image of 
God. 

 
II Corinthians 3:5 

Not that we are competent in 
ourselves to claim anything 
for ourselves, but our 
competence comes from God. 

 
II Corinthians 2:15 

For we are to God the 
pleasing aroma of Christ 
among those who are being 
saved and those who are 
perishing. 

 
II Corinthians 5:7 

For we live by faith, not by 
sight 

 
II Corinthians 4:18 

So we fix our eyes not on what 
is seen, but on what is 
unseen, since what is seen is 
temporary, but what is unseen 
is eternal. 

 
II Corinthians 4:17 

For our light and momentary 
troubles are achieving for us 
an eternal glory that far 
outweighs them all. 

               
II Corinthians 5:17 

Therefore, if anyone is in 
Christ, the new creation has 
come: The old has gone, the 
new is here! 
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II Corinthians 5:10 

For we must all appear before 
the judgment seat of Christ, so 
that each of us may receive 
what is due us for the things 
done while in the body, 
whether good or bad. 

 

 


