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Competition 3 Verse References  
 

 
I Corinthians 9:27 

No, I strike a blow to my body 
and make it my slave so that 
after I have preached to 
others, I myself will not be 
disqualified for the prize. 

 
I Corinthians 9:25 

Everyone who competes in 
the games goes into strict 
training. They do it to get a 
crown that will not last, but we 
do it to get a crown that will 
last forever. 

 
I Corinthians 9:22 

To the weak I became weak, 
to win the weak. I have 
become all things to all people 
so that by all possible means I 
might save some. 

 
I Corinthians 10:21 

You cannot drink the cup of 
the Lord and the cup of 
demons too; you cannot have 
a part in both the Lord's table 
and the table of demons. 

 
I Corinthians 10:13 

No temptation has overtaken 
you except what is common to 
mankind. And God is faithful; 
he will not let you be tempted 
beyond what you can bear. 
But when you are tempted, he 
will also provide a way out so 
that you can endure it. 

 
I Corinthians 10:12 

So, if you think you are 
standing firm, be careful that 
you don't fall! 

               
I Corinthians 12:7 

Now to each one the 
manifestation of the Spirit is 
given for the common good. 
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I Corinthians 11:27 

So then, whoever eats the 
bread or drinks the cup of the 
Lord in a unworthy manner will 
be guilty of sinning against the 
body and blood of the Lord. 

 

 


